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"longer than five years. except of lands 
to be or within a legally created graz­
ing district, when such lease ma~' run 
for a period of not to exceed ten years.' 

It is apparent that Chapter 65 is in­
tended to include a new method of 
lea'sing tax title lands owned by coun­
ties. It extends the term of leasing an(l 
to that extent amends the prior stat­
ute. I believe that such law also re­
lieves the commissioners from the lim­
itation imposed b~' the prior statute to 
the effect that all propert~· must be 
leased subject to sale. As noted in your 
letter, the earlier sta tute is a general 
statute, the later statute a special stat­
ute. The earlier sta'tnte contains a 
limitation on certain leases, the later 
statute authorizes different leases with 
no mention of a limitation. 

Dnder the decisions of the Supreme 
Court. of this state it would appear 
that the implied repeal removes the 
limitation noted. Reagan v. Boyd, 5n 
Mont. 4503; Barth v. EI~', 85 ~Iont. 0310: 
London G. & A. Co. Ltd., v. Industrial 
Accident Board, 82 Mont. 304; City of 
Butte v. Industrial Accident Board, 
52 Mont. 75.) 

It would seem, however, that there 
is nothing in the statute to pre\'ent 
commissio'ners from leasing tax lands 
subject to sale, if they so desire. 

Opinion No. 514 

Relief-Relief Commission-Supplies, 
Pm'chase of -State Pur­

chasing Agent. 

HELD: Jt is not necessary that pur­
chases of supplies for the Montana Re­
lief Commission be made through the 
State Purchasing Agent. 

April 16, 1034. 

Inquiry is made as to whether pur­
chases made in the administration of 
relief funds by the Montana Relief 
Commission as provided by Chapter 56 
of the Laws of the Extraordinary Ses­
sion, 193.'3-1034, may be made by the 
Commission or must he made through 
the Purchasing Department. 

This law provides that the funds 
shall be administered under the same 
rules and regulations provided by such 
Commission for the administration of 
Federal relief funds. Chapter 10 of the 

Political Code, and particularl~' Sec­
tion 285, R. C. ~L 1921, relate to the 
power of the PurchaSing Agent and 
proYide that all supplies are to be pur­
chased through the State Purchasing 
Agent. The various sections of this 
Chapter ha\'e been somewhat amended. 
The law explaining the duties of the 
Purchasing Agent certainly applies to 
all departments of the State Govern­
ment unless express proviSions else, 
where contained demand otherwise. 

It would appear that it was the in­
tent of the State Legislature that, (by 
reason of the necessity of the Bmer· 
gency Relief Commission ha \'ing to 
make purchases throughout various 
parts of the State, and to distribute 
supplies so purchased immediately to 
those in need) it was impossible to 
make purchases through the State Pur­
chaSing Department, and to substitute 
for such method of making purchases 
the rules and regulations proyided by 
such Commission for the Administra­
tion of Federal Relief Funds. 

I, therefore, believe that it is not 
necessary that such purchases he made 
through the Htate Purchasing Agent. 

Opinion No. 515 

County Commissionel's-Highways 
-Joint Maintenance of Roads 
-;Cotinties, Roads in Another 

County. 

HELD: Boards of County Commi:;­
:;ioners have the power to aet jointly 
in laying out, controlling amI main­
taining public highways in adjacent 
conn ties. But it is extremely doubtful 
tim t a hoard of count~' commis:;ioner:; 
is vested with power to aet alone to 
improve or keep in a state of repair 
that part of a highwa~' running from 
that county into an9ther, which lies 
in the latter county. 

April 18, 1034. 
We acknowledge receipt of yours of 

the 20th adviSing that. one of your im­
portant roads leading into Lh'ingston 
extends into Sweet Grass County; that 
Sweet Grass County refuses to keep 
the part of such road in that county in 
condition suitable for tra\'el, and your 
board of county commissioners desires 
to know whether it has the power to 
expend money to maintain that part of 
the road in Sweet Grass County. It 
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